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Introduction 
The lands of Zakhara, originally presented in 
the Al-Qadim campaign setting line in the early 
1990s, provide new and exciting options for 
experienced and new players alike. Located far 
to the south of Faerûn, across steep mountains 
and forbidding seas, Zakhara has a culture all 
its own⸺a culture based in equal parts on the 
Arabian Nights and 1950s Hollywood glamor. 

 
This booklet provides all the information you 
need to create a Zakharan character for a 5th 
Edition game. We begin with an overview of 
what makes Zakharan characters different 
from those you might find in other campaigns, 
then provide guidelines on how to create such 
a character. 
 
The sections ahead are patterned off 
those found in the 5th Edition Player’s 
Handbook. Campaign Guide: Zakhara 
- Adventures in the Land of Fate, the 
unofficial 5th Edition guidebook to 
Zakhara, can be useful in 
creating a Zakharan character, 
but that book is not necessary to 
use this guide.  

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

  



 

 
 

Creating a Zakharan Character 
Zakharan characters use the same rules, 
character classes, and other features as any 
other 5th Edition characters. 

As part of creating your character, however, it 
will be useful to decide whether you wish your 
character to be one of the millions who dwell 
in Zakhara’s great cities (known as al-Hadhar), 
or one of the proud and independent dwellers 
in the deserts (known as al-Badia). This 
distinction is one of the most important factors 
in Zakharan life, and will impact your 
character more than almost any other. 

Another important concept to keep in mind is 
the idea of Enlightened vs. Unenlightened 
creatures. Zakharan society is built around a 
code of conduct called the Law of the 
Loregiver, which defines ideals such as piety, 
decency, and camaraderie. Characters who 
follow the Law of the Loregiver are commonly 
referred to as Enlightened characters; those 
who do not are known as Unenlightened. 
While there are no specific rules distinguishing 
between these two groups, the overwhelming 
majority of Zakharans are Enlightened, and 
acceptance into mainstream Zakharan society 
assumes characters follow the Law of the 
Loregiver. 

 

AL-HADHAR 
Zakhara boasts the largest cities on the world 
al-Toril, and the folk who come from those 
metropolises are known as al-Hadhar. These 
city-dwellers are accustomed to the 
conveniences of ready goods and food 
available for purchase, and take comfort in the 
presence of many thousands of strangers 
living nearby. An al-Hadhar character is more 
likely to belong to the Bard or Rogue classes, 

which thrive within large population centers, 
and al-Hadhar Clerics are far more likely to 
belong to distinct temples and ordered faiths. 
Al-Hadhar are also much more likely to focus 
on urban skills such as Performance or Sleight 
of Hand. 

 

AL-BADIA 
Zakhara’s al-Badia, on the other hand, are 
accustomed to the freedom and isolation of 
wide open spaces. Most al-Badia belong to one 
of Zakhara’s many desert-dwelling tribes, and 
they often feel constrained and limited by the 
walls of a city and suffocated by high 
population densities. An al-Badia character is 
more likely to be a Barbarian, Druid, or Ranger 
- character classes who do not require the 
presence of institutions and large populations. 
Even so, the desert-dwellers certainly boast 
their fair share of bards and rawuns, who 
carry on their storytelling traditions. Al-Badia 
characters are also likely to focus on 
wilderness-based skills such as Animal 
Handling, Nature, and Survival. 
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RACES/ANCESTRIES 
Zakharan characters can be of any race or 
ancestry your Dungeon Master allows. People 
in Zakhara place far greater value on a 
character’s actions than their appearance or 
bearing, so some races considered “monstrous” 
in other lands - such as goblins, orcs, and even 
ogres - find a much greater degree of 
acceptance in Zakhara. 

Since most of Zakhara shares the same general 
culture, racial enclaves and kingdoms are 
virtually unknown. While major cities may 
have an “elf neighborhood” or a “gnome 
village” within them, such occurrences are 
rare. While individual dwarves may prefer the 
company of other dwarves to the company of 
halflings or gnomes, for example, Zakharans 
by and large react to characters based on their 
behavior, not their lineage.  

 

CLASSES AND ARCHETYPES 
All classes and subclasses found in the Player’s 
Handbook can be found in Zakhara, though 
Zakharans may use different terminology to 
describe them. The table on the following page 
lists Zakharan terms for different archetypes 
and character concepts. Some terms are also 
the names of subclasses, backgrounds, or 
character Kits (see below), but none of them 
require a character to take any particular 
classes or options. 

Zakharans have access to a few subclasses not 
found elsewhere. The table on this page lists 
these subclasses, their associated character 
class, and where to find them. 
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KITS 
Campaign Guide: Zakahra - Adventures in the 
Land of Fate, along with other products from 
Miniature Giant Space Hamster Press, 
introduces a new character option called a Kit. 

A character Kit is similar to a background, 
except a character must meet certain 
qualifications to take a Kit, and a Kit is gained 
at higher levels - typically 5th. Like 
backgrounds, kits are intended to add a touch 
of flavor to a class while providing a small 
mechanical boost.  

Kits are purely optional, but can absolutely 
help make characters feel more like they are 

part of the setting. A chart summarizing 
available kits and where to find them appears 
below.  

Note that the Zakharans worship a pantheon 
of gods quite different from those found in the 
Player’s Handbook. Zakharans categorize gods 
and faiths between those that are listed in the 
Law of the Loregiver (known as Enlightened 
gods) and those that are not (known as 
Unenlightened). In addition, some regions of 
Zakhara have local deities unknown or less 
common in other areas. See “Gods and Faiths,” 
on page 10, for more details.  
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PERSONALITY AND BACKGROUND 
Zakharan characters can have any personality 
and background you like. All ideals, bonds, and 
flaws from the Player’s Handbook are 
appropriate for and available to Zakharan 
characters. You can use the following sections 
on Zakharan names, Zakharan gods, and 
Zakharan cities to help tailor your character to 
the setting. 
 

NAME 

Zakharan characters’ names typically sound 
like names from the Middle Eastern region of 
our world. Some examples are below; 
additional examples as well as more surname 
options can be found in Campaign Guide: 
Zakhara - Adventures in the Land of Fate. 
 

SURNAMES 
One of the most popular forms of Zakharan 
surnames combines the name of a place or 
location with the suffix -i. For example, Al-
Kharji means “the person from Kharj.”  

Al means “the,” and may also be followed by a 
descriptive name, as in al-Nasr (“the eagle”). In 
addition, al may mean “the house of” or “the 
tribe of.” 

 

LANGUAGES 
In Zakhara, the Common or trade tongue is 
called Midani, and it is by far the most 
commonly used language. For Zakharan 
characters, the terms “Common” and “Midani” 
are interchangeable when it comes to 
languages. While our default assumption is 
that Midani is distinctl from the Common 
tongue spoken elsewhere, your Dungeon 
Master and group can decide whether to 
maintain this distinction. 

Since Zakharans tend not to divide themselves 
along racial lines (see “Races/Ancestries” 
above), languages such as Elven, Dwarven, and 
similar tongues are less common in the Land of 
Fate. While those languages are preserved by 
scholars, mostly for archival purposes, 
Zakharan characters are more likely to learn 
languages from the Exotic Languages table in 
the Player’s Handbook. 

 

EQUIPMENT 
Most equipment listed in the Player’s 
Handbook is available in Zakhara, though 
some items are much rarer (such as rapiers) or 
simply impractical in the land’s heat (such as 
heavy armor). The following table lists 
Zakharan equipment along with equivalent 
gear from the Player’s Handbook.  

For more information on Zakharan equipment 
and magical items, see Kazerabet’s Keepsakes. 

For information on Zakharan ships and 
sailing, see Sea Devils of the Pale Hand.       
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Ankus. Also called an elephant goad, this 14-18" 
rod is primarily designed to control and direct 
the movement of large animals.  

Cutlass. This curved sword has a wide blade 
weighted at one end and is a common sidearm 
among corsairs and other seafarers.  

Daraq. A small shield generally made of 
tortoise shell or reinforced hide, a daraq (dah-
RACK) can be strapped to the arm, leaving a 
person's hand free to use for other purposes. 

Due to its small size, however, the daraq can 
only be used against one specific attack every 
round. 

Great Scimitar. This massive, curved  two-
handed sword is also known as a "headsman's 
sword" due to its popularity among 
executioners.  

Jambiya. The signature tool and weapon of the 
desert peoples, the jambiyah (JAHM-bee-yah) is 
a double-edged knife with a curved blade, used 
for everything from eating to self-defense to 
assassination.  

Katar. Also called a punch dagger, the katar 
(kah-TAHR) is designed so its blade is 
perpendicular to its hilt, forming a T-shape. 

Lamellar Armor. Constructed of small metal 
scales connected by metal links, lamellar 
(LAMB-ell-ahr) is the heaviest armor 
commonly seen in the Land of Fate. Even so, it 
is worn mostly by those in cooler areas. 

Shamshir. A longer scimitar favored by horse 
riders and nobles, the shamshir (shahm-
SHEER) is commonly decorated and worn as a 
fashion accessory, even by those unskilled in 
using it as a weapon.  



 

 
 

Gods and Faiths 
Though the Zakharan peninsula is part of the 
larger Forgotten Realms campaign setting, 
Zakhara shares almost no gods, faiths, or 
religions with the broader Realms. Zakharans 
have their own pantheon of deities, which is 
further subdivided into three categories: Major 
or Great gods have temples and shrines in all 
major cities, Local or Common gods can be 
found in only a few cities or regions, and 
Savage or heathen gods, which are outside the 
Law of the Loregiver and are considered 
Unenlightened. There are also a small number 
of deities that are all but unknown in 

Zakharan society; these are sometimes referred 
to as Forgotten gods. 

The following chart lists the most common 
Zakharan gods and faiths, along with the 
classification of each and the cause for which 
it is known. One region of Zakhara, known as 
the League of the Pantheon or the Pantheist 
League, recognizes only a small subset of 
Zakharan deities. The gods recognized by this 
group are marked with (Pantheon) after the 
god’s status.  

For more information on the Zakharan gods 
and faiths, see Campaign Guide: Zakhara - 
Adventures in the Land of Fate. 
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Places 
Though Zakhara is most famous for its vast 
and forbidding deserts, in truth all terrain 
types can be found within its borders. An 
extremely detailed map of Zakhara is available 
at the Forgotten Realms Wiki and can be found 
here: 
 
https://static.wikia.nocookie.net/forgottenreal
ms/images/8/8c/Zakhara.jpg/revision/latest?cb
=20100224201659 
 
A smaller map, suitable for general navigation 
and featuring the major cities with numbers 
corresponding to the table below, can be found 
on the previous page. 
   

CITIES OF ZAKHARA  
Zakhara boasts the largest cities on the face of 
Toril (which the Zakharans refer to as Al-Toril). 
Each of Zakhara’s 27 major cities boasts 
hundreds of thousands of residents, making 
them marvels of urban planning, 
infrastructure, and industry. However, the 
continent also contains a handful of  

  

https://static.wikia.nocookie.net/forgottenrealms/images/8/8c/Zakhara.jpg/revision/latest?cb=20100224201659
https://static.wikia.nocookie.net/forgottenrealms/images/8/8c/Zakhara.jpg/revision/latest?cb=20100224201659
https://static.wikia.nocookie.net/forgottenrealms/images/8/8c/Zakhara.jpg/revision/latest?cb=20100224201659
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significant minor cities, which lack the 
grandeur and scale of the metropoles but still 
appear on most maps. 

Zakharan classify the major cities into five 
major groups: Cities of the Heart, Cities of the 
North, Cities of the Pearl, Cities of the 
Pantheon, and Cities of the Ancients. Minor 
cities are not considered part of this grouping.  

The tables above list the major cities and minor 
cities, respectively, and the city numbers 
correspond to the included map. 

For more information on the cities of Zakhara, 
including the city rulers, exports, and more, see 
Campaign Guide: Zakhara - Adventures in the 
Land of Fate. 

WASTES OF ZAKHARA 
Al-Badia who live in Zakhara’s two great 
deserts, the High Desert and the Haunted 
Lands, generally belong to a desert tribe. Such 
tribes can be enormous and consist of many 
smaller clans, but all members of a tribe 
answer to the leader of that tribe, called the 
Sheik. The largest and most common tribes in 
Zakhara are listed below, along with the desert 
they inhabit. 

For additional information on Zakhara’s 
wastes and the desert tribes, including the 
janni tribes, see Campaign Guide: Zakhara - 
Adventures in the Land of Fate. 

  



 

 
 

Customization Options 
For campaigns using the optional 
Multiclassing and Feat rules from the Player’s 
Handbook, we present the following 
guidelines. 

MULTICLASSING 
Characters in Zakhara follow the same rules 
for multiclassing as characters elsewhere. 
However, many Zakharans look distrustfully 
upon characters who multiclass too liberally, 
feeling such individuals lack dedication and 
focus. On the other hand, Zakharan 
pragmatism also acknowledges that it’s always 

handy to have more and unexpected tricks and 
tactics with which to approach a problem. 

FEATS 
Following from the Zakharan appreciation for 
dedication and focus comes a fondness for 
specialization and a flair for dramatic 
demonstrations of skill. Zakharan 
swordmasters are renowned for their displays 
of weapon prowess, for example, and you can 
represent that prowess through feats such as 
Martial Adept. Similarly, feats such as 
Sharpshooter can help define a character 
known for their dead-eye aim. 
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